Contractural Custodial Services FY24-26

Bid Opening Thursday, September 7 2023; 11:00 AM

Apparent Bidder| [ DISQUALIFIED DISQUALIFIED DISQUALIFIED
Uncle Sam's Contractors LLC AllPro Cleaning Services S.J. Services Dynamic Janitorial Cleaning, Inc. Spotless Cleaning, Inc Moura's Cleaning Service Inc. Partner Facililty Solutions | Express Janitorial Service Group]  MrVigne Cleaning Services
90 Roberts Street, Ste 302 134 Flanders Road, Ste 325 235 Newbury St 176 Main Street 22 Commerce Blvd, Suite 3 349 Lunenburg St 265 Franklin St, Ste 1702 PO Box 80376 1257 Worcester Road 1028
East Hartford, CT 06108 Westborough, MA 01581 Danvers, MA 01923 Milford, MA 01757 Plainville, MA 02762 Fitchburg, MA 01420 Boston, MA 02110 Stoneham, MA 02180 Framingham, MA 01701
PO Box 8162
Manchester CT 06040
Did not use revised addenda Did not use revised addenda Did not use revised addenda
form form form
K Bid Bond - business check Bid Bond - cashiers check Bid Bond 5% Bid Bond - Cert check Bid Bond 5% Bid Bond 5% NO BID SURETY NO BID SURETY
‘g Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Monthly Bid Monthly Bid
jr > Location Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost] Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost] Bid Price Annual Cost] Price Annual Cost| Price Annual Cost}
24 9 Library $ 1,387.00 $ 12,483.00 | $ 1,209.58 $ 10,886.22 | S 1,245.00 $ 11,205.00 | $ 1,897.00 $ 17,073.00 | $ 1,895.00 $ 17,055.00 | $ 2,047.09 $ 18,423.81 ] $2,041.00 $ 18,369.00 | $ 1,678.00 $ 15,102.00 | $ 16,020.00 $ 144,180.00
error $ 24,565.08 error $  20,140.00
24 Police Dept S 694.00 $ 6,246.00 S 1,169.17 $ 10,522.53 | $ 1,089.00 $ 9,801.00 f $ 1,097.00 $ 9,873.00|$ 1,625.00 S 14,625.00 | $ 1,364.72 $ 12,282.48 | $1,360.00 $ 12,240.00 | $ 1,646.00 $ 14,814.00 | S 6,808.00 $ 61,272.00
error $ 16,376.72 error $ 19,753.00
24 9 Fire Dept S 694.00 $ 6,246.00 S 1,169.17 $ 10,522.53 | $ 1,089.00 $ 9,801.00 f $ 1,097.00 $ 9,873.00]$ 1,625.00 $ 14,625.00 | $ 1,364.72 $ 12,282.48 | $ 1,360.00 $ 12,240.00 | $ 902.00 $ 8,118.00| $ 6,808.00 $ 61,272.00
error $ 16,376.72 error $ 10,819.00
24 9 DPW S 555.00 $ 4,995.00 | $ 43333 S 3,899.97 | $ 932.00 S 8,388.00§ S 997.00 $ 8,973.00| S 1,083.00 S 9,747.00 | S 1,023.54 $ 9,211.86 | $ 1,020.00 $ 9,180.00 | $ 1,293.00 S 11,637.00 | $ 704.00 $ 6,336.00
error $ 12,282.54 error $ 15,513.00
24 9 Houghton S 277.00 $ 2,493.00 ] $ 43333 $ 3,899.97 ] $ 622.00 $ 5,598.00§ $ 997.00 $ 8,973.00]$ 1,083.00 $ 9,747.00 | $ 1,023.54 $ 9,211.86 | $1,020.00 $ 9,180.00 | $ 1,739.00 $ 15,651.00 | $ 1,220.00 $ 10,980.00
error $ 12,282.54 error $  20,866.00
24 9 Town Hall S 832.00 $ 7,488.00 | $ 595.83 $ 5,362.47 S 1,245.00 S 11,205.00 | $ 1,627.00 $ 14,643.00 | $ 1,300.00 $ 11,700.00 | $ 1,364.72 $ 12,282.48 | $2,381.16 $ 21,430.44 | S 1,893.00 $ 17,037.00 | $ 4,740.00 $ 42,660.00
error $ 16,376.72 error $  22,718.00
24 Special event per hour S 35.00 3 hr min S 30.00 S 30.00 S 28.00 S 30.00 S 45.00 $  32.00 $ 35.00 4 hrmin $ 50.00
24 Emergency Response - Normal hours per | $ 35.00 3hrmin S 45.00 S 32.00 S 39.00 S 30.00 S 45.00 $  38.00 $ 35.00 4 hrmin $ 41.00
Emergency Response - After hours per S 35.00 S 45.00 S 38.00 S 47.00 S 30.00 S 60.00 S 42.00 $ 35.00 4 hr min $ 45.00
FY 2024 (9 months) $ 39,951.00 $ 45,093.69 $ 55,998.00 S 69,408.00 $ 77,499.00 $ 73,694.97 $ 82,639.44 $  82,359.00 $  326,700.00
error $ 98,260.32
25 12 Library $ 1,387.00 $ 16,644.00 | S 1,244.66 S 14,935.92 | $ 1,282.00 $ 15,384.00 | $ 1,897.00 $ 22,764.00 | S 1,895.00 $ 22,740.00 | $ 2,149.44 S 25,793.28 | $2,143.05 $ 25,716.60 | $ 1,678.00 S  20,136.00 | $16,020.00 $ 192,240.00
error S 22,750.00 error $  20,140.00 error $  144,180.00
25 12 Police Dept S 694.00 $ 8,328.000 $ 1,203.08 $ 14,436.96 | $ 1,121.00 $ 13,452.00 | $ 1,097.00 $ 13,164.00 | $ 1,625.00 $ 19,500.00 | $ 1,432.96 $ 17,195.52 | $1,428.00 $ 17,136.00 | $ 1,646.00 $ 19,752.00 | $ 6,808.00 $ 81,696.00
error $ 19,753.00 error S 61,272.00
25 12 Fire Dept S 694.00 $ 8,328.00 $ 1,203.08 $ 14,436.96 | $ 1,121.00 $ 13,452.00 | $ 1,097.00 $ 13,164.00 | $ 1,625.00 $ 19,500.00 | $ 1,432.96 $ 17,195.52 | $1,428.00 $ 17,136.00 | S 902.00 $ 10,824.00 | $ 6,808.00 $ 81,696.00
error $ 10,819.00 error $ 61,272.00
25 12 DPW S 555.00 $ 6,660.00 | $ 44590 S 5,350.80 ) $ 959.00 $ 11,508.00 $ 997.00 $ 11,964.00 | $ 1,083.00 $ 12,996.00 | $ 1,074.72 $ 12,896.64 | $1,071.00 $ 12,852.00 | $ 1,293.00 $ 15,516.00 | $ 704.00 $ 8,448.00
S 13,000.00 error S 1,513.00 error S 6,336.00
25 12 Houghton S 277.00 $ 3,324.00) $ 44590 S 5,350.80 | $ 640.00 $ 7,680.00§ S 997.00 $ 11,964.00 | $ 1,083.00 $ 12,996.00 | $ 1,074.72 $ 12,896.64 | $1,071.00 $ 12,852.00 | $ 1,739.00 $ 20,868.00 | S 1,220.00 S 14,640.00
error S 13,000.00 error $  20,866.00 error $ 10,980.00
25 12 Town Hall S 832.00 $ 9,984.00 | $ 613.11 S 7,357.32] S 1,282.00 $ 15,384.00 | $ 1,627.00 $ 19,524.00 | $ 1,300.00 $ 15,600.00 | $ 1,432.96 $ 17,195.52 | $2,500.21 $ 30,002.52 | $ 1,893.00 $ 22,716.00| $ 4,740.00 $ 56,880.00
error $ 7,357.92 error $  22,718.00 error S 42,660.00
25 Special event per hour S 35.00 3hrmin S 30.00 S 31.00 S 28.00 S 30.00 S 47.25 S  33.60 S 35.00 4 hrmin S 50.00
25 Emergency Response - Normal hours per | $ 35.00 3hrmin S 45.00 S 33.00 $ 39.00 S 30.00 S 47.25 $  39.90 S 35.00 4 hrmin $ 41.00
Emergency Response - After hours per S 35.00 3hrmin S 45.00 S 39.00 S 47.00 S 35.00 S 63.00 S 4410 S 35.00 4 hr min S 45.00
FY 2025 (12 months)| $ 53,268.00 $ 61,868.76 $ 76,860.00 S 92,544.00 S 103,332.00 $ 103,173.12 $ 115,695.12 $ 109,812.00 $  435,600.00
error S 61,869.36 error $ 103,350.00 error
26 12 Library S 1,467.00 $ 17,604.00 | S 1,280.76 S 15,369.12 | $ 1,320.00 $ 15,840.00 | $ 1,897.00 $ 22,764.00 | $ 1,952.71 S 23,432.52 ] S 2,256.92 $ 27,083.04 | $2,250.20 S 27,002.40 S 1,678.00 S  20,136.00 | $16,070.00 $ 192,840.00
error $ 17,610.00 error S 23,432.50 error $ 27,083.00 error S 27,002.43 error $  20,140.00 error $  144,180.00
26 12 Police Dept $ 73400 S 8,808.00 | $ 1,237.97 $ 14,855.64 | S 1,154.00 $ 13,848.00 | $ 1,097.00 $ 13,164.00 | $ 1,673.75 $ 20,085.00 | $ 1,504.60 $ 18,055.20 | $1,499.40 $ 17,992.80 | $ 1,646.00 $ 19,752.00| $ 6,808.00 $ 81,696.00
error $ 18,055.33 error $ 19,753.00 error S 61,272.00
26 12 Fire Dept S 734.00 $ 8,808.00 $ 1,23797 $ 14,855.64 | S 1,154.00 $ 13,848.00 | $ 1,097.00 $ 13,164.00 | $ 1,673.75 $ 20,085.00 | $ 1,504.60 $ 18,055.20 | $1,499.40 $ 17,992.80 | $ 902.00 $ 10,824.00 | $ 6,808.00 $ 81,696.00
error $ 18,055.33 error $ 10,819.00 error S 61,272.00
26 12 DPW S 587.00 $ 7,044.00 ) $ 458.83 S 5,505.96 | $ 987.00 S 11,844.00 | $ 997.00 $ 11,964.00 | $ 1,115.00 $ 13,380.00 | $ 1,128.45 $ 13,541.40 | $1,124.55 $ 13,494.60 | $ 1,293.00 $ 15,516.00 | S 704.00 $ 8,448.00
error S 13,390.00 error $ 13,541.50 error $ 15,513.00 error S 6,336.00
26 12 Houghton S 294.00 $ 3,528.00] $ 458.83 S 5,505.96 | $ 659.00 $ 7,908.00§ $ 997.00 $ 11,964.00 | $ 1,115.00 $ 13,380.00 | $ 1,128.45 $ 13,541.40 | $1,12455 $ 13,494.60 | $ 1,739.00 $ 20,868.00] S 1,220.00 $ 14,640.00
error S 13,390.00 error $ 13,541.50 error $  20,866.00 error S 10,980.00
26 12 Town Hall S 880.00 $ 10,560.00 | $ 630.89 $ 7,570.68 | S 1,320.00 S 15,840.00 | $ 1,627.00 $ 19,524.00 | $ 1,339.00 $ 16,068.00 | $ 1,504.60 $ 18,055.20 | $ 2,625.22 S 31,502.64 | S 1,893.00 S 22,716.00 | $ 4,740.00 $ 56,880.00
error $ 18,055.33 error S 31,502.65 error $  22,718.00 error S 42,660.00
26 Special event per hour S 35.00 3hrmin S 30.00 S 32.00 S 28.00 S 30.00 S 49.60 S 35.00 4 hrmin S 50.00
Emergency Response - Normal hours per
26 hr S 34.00 3hrmin S 45.00 S 34.00 S 39.00 S 30.00 S 49.60 S 35.00 4 hrmin S 41.00
Emergency Response - After hours per
hour S 35.00 3hrmin S 45.00 S 40.00 S 47.00 S 35.00 S 66.15 S 35.00 4 hrmin S 45.00
FY 2026 (12 months)| $ 56,352.00 $ 63,663.00 S 79,128.00 S 92,544.00 S 106,430.52 $ 108,331.44 $ 121,479.84 $ 109,812.00 $  436,200.00
error $ 56,358.00 error $ 106,450.50 error $ 121,479.88 error $ 109,809.00 error $  326,700.00
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Contractural Custodial Services FY24-26

Bid Opening Thursday, September 7 2023; 11:00 AM

Apparent Bidder| [ DISQUALIFIED DISQUALIFIED DISQUALIFIED
Uncle Sam's Contractors LLC AllPro Cleaning Services S.J. Services Dynamic Janitorial Cleaning, Inc. Spotless Cleaning, Inc Moura's Cleaning Service Inc. Partner Facililty Solutions | Express Janitorial Service Group]  MrVigne Cleaning Services
90 Roberts Street, Ste 302 134 Flanders Road, Ste 325 235 Newbury St 176 Main Street 22 Commerce Blvd, Suite 3 349 Lunenburg St 265 Franklin St, Ste 1702 PO Box 80376 1257 Worcester Road 1028
East Hartford, CT 06108 Westborough, MA 01581 Danvers, MA 01923 Milford, MA 01757 Plainville, MA 02762 Fitchburg, MA 01420 Boston, MA 02110 Stoneham, MA 02180 Framingham, MA 01701
PO Box 8162
Manchester CT 06040
Did not use revised addenda Did not use revised addenda Did not use revised addenda
form form form
K Bid Bond - business check Bid Bond - cashiers check Bid Bond 5% Bid Bond - Cert check Bid Bond 5% Bid Bond 5% NO BID SURETY NO BID SURETY
‘g Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Monthly Bid Monthly Bid
oo S Locition Price Annual Costl Price Annual Costl Price Annual Costl Price Annual Cost] Price Annual Costl Price Annual Cost] Bid Price Annual Costl Price Annual Costl Price Annual Costl
OPTIONAL SERVICES
Carpet Cleaning
Town Hall} FY24 S 415.00 FY24 0.22/sf FY24 S 1,500.00 FY24 .27/sf FY24 S 493.75 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 1,440.00 FY24 S 1,792.00 FY24 S 13,500.00
FY25 S 415.00 FY25 0.22/sf FY25 S 1,600.00 FY25 .27/sf FY25 S 493.75 FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 1,512.00 FY25 S 1,792.00 FY25 S 13,500.00
FY26 S 415.00 FY26 0.22/sf FY26 S 1,700.00 FY26 .27/sf FY26 S 508.56 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 1,587.60 FY26 S 1,792.00 FY26 S 13,500.00
Public Safety] FY24 S 1,135.00 FY24 0.22/sf FY24 S 1,500.00 FY24 .27/sf FY24 S 630.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 1,440.00 FY24 S 1,993.00 FY24 S 22,500.00
FY25 S 1,135.00 FY25 0.22/sf FY25 S 1,600.00 FY25 .27/sf FY25 S - FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 1,512.00 FY25 S 1,993.00 FY25 S 22,500.00
FY26 S 1,135.00 FY26 0.22/sf FY26 S 1,700.00 FY26 .27/sf FY26 S 648.90 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 1,587.60 FY26 S 1,993.00 FY26 S 22,500.00
Houghton FY24 S 210.00 FY24 0.22/sf FY24 S 800.00 FY24 .27/sf FY24 S 253.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 720.00 FY24 S 1,352.00 FY24 S 9,000.00
FY25 S 210.00 FY25 0.22/sf FY25 S 850.00 FY25 .27/sf FY25 S - FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 756.00 FY25 S 1,352.00 FY25 S 9,000.00
FY26 S 210.00 FY26 0.22/sf FY26 S 900.00 FY26 .27/sf FY26 S 260.59 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 793.80 FY26 S 1,352.00 FY26 S 9,000.00
Library FY24 S 1,780.00 FY24 0.22/sf FY24 S 1,950.00 FY24 .27/sf FY24 S 3,337.50 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 2,160.00 FY24 S 1,885.00 FY24 S 27,000.00
FY25 S 1,780.00 FY25 0.22/sf FY25 S 2,000.00 FY25 .27/sf FY25 S 3,337.00 FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 2,268.00 FY25 S 1,885.00 FY25 S 27,000.00
FY26 S 1,780.00 FY26 0.22/sf FY26 S 2,100.00 FY26 .27/sf FY26 S 3,337.00 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 2,381.40 FY26 S 1,885.00 FY26 S 27,000.00
DPW Office FY24 S 210.00 FY24 0.22/sf FY24 S 600.00 FY24 .27/sf FY24 S 150.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 450.00 FY24 S 278.00 FY24 S 7,920.00
FY25 S 210.00 FY25 0.22/sf FY25 S 650.00 FY25 .27/sf FY25 S 150.00 FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 472.50 FY25 S 278.00 FY25 S 7,920.00
FY26 S 210.00 FY26 0.22/sf FY26 S 700.00 FY26 .27/sf FY26 S 150.00 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 496.13 FY26 S 278.00 FY26 S 7,920.00
Hard Floor Stripping & waxing
Town Hall Lower level FY24 S 260.00 FY24 .32/sf FY24 S 1,000.00 FY24 .75/sf FY24 S 1,481.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 660.00 FY24 S 712.00 FY24 S 1,500.00
FY25 S 260.00 FY25 .32/sf FY25 S 1,100.00 FY25 .75/sf FY25 S 1,481.00 FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 693.00 FY25 S 712.00 FY25 S 1,500.00
FY26 S 260.00 FY26 .32/sf FY26 S 1,200.00 FY26 .75 sf FY26 S 1,481.00 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 727.65 FY26 S 712.00 FY26 S 1,500.00
Public Safety FY24 S 2,270.00 FY24 .32/sf FY24 S 1,500.00 FY24 .75/sf FY24 S 1,917.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 880.00 FY24 S 961.00 FY24 S 1,000.00
FY25 S 2,270.00 FY25 .32/sf FY25 S 1,600.00 FY25 .75/sf FY25 S 1,971.00 FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 924.00 FY25 S 961.00 FY25 S 1,000.00
FY26 S 2,270.00 FY26 .32/sf FY26 S 1,700.00 FY26 .75 sf FY26 S 1,971.00 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 970.20 FY26 S 961.00 FY26 S 1,000.00
DPW Office FY24 S 260.00 FY24 .32/sf FY24 S 600.00 FY24 .75/sf FY24 S 440.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 S 550.00 FY24 S 518.00 FY24 S 795.00
FY25 S 260.00 FY25 .32/sf FY25 S 700.00 FY25 .75/sf FY25 S 440.00 FY25 to be quoted FY25 S 577.50 FY25 S 518.00 FY25 S 795.00
FY26 S 260.00 FY26 .32/sf FY26 S 800.00 FY26 .75 sf FY26 S 440.00 FY26 to be quoted FY26 S 606.38 FY26 S 518.00 FY26 S 795.00
Library FY24 S 260.00 FY24 .32/sf FY24 S 900.00 FY24 .75/sf FY24 S - FY24 to be quoted FY24 N/A FY24 No Bid FY24 S 800.00
FY25 S 260.00 FY25 .32/sf FY25 S 1,000.00 FY25 .75/sf FY25 S - FY25 to be quoted FY25 N/A FY25 No Bid FY25 S 800.00
FY26 S 260.00 FY26 .32/sf FY26 S 1,100.00 FY26 .75 sf FY26 S - FY26 to be quoted FY26 N/A FY26 No Bid FY26 S 800.00
Tile Floor & Wall Steam Cleaning
Public Safety & Fire| FY24 S 490.00 FY24 .25/sf FY24 S 1,500.00 FY24 .55/sf FY24 S 350.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 N/A FY24 S 891.00 FY24 S 18,000.00
FY25 S 490.00 FY25 .25/sf FY25 S 1,600.00 FY25 .55/sf FY25 S 350.00 FY25 to be quoted FY25 N/A FY25 S 891.00 FY25 S 18,000.00
FY26 S 490.00 FY26 .25/sf FY26 S 1,700.00 FY26 .55/sf FY26 S 350.00 FY26 to be quoted FY26 N/A FY26 S 891.00 FY26 S 18,000.00
Library FY24 S 490.00 FY24 .25/sf FY24 S 1,200.00 FY24 .55/sf FY24 S 250.00 FY24 to be quoted FY24 N/A FY24 S 715.00 FY24 S 21,470.00
FY25 S 490.00 FY25 .25/sf FY25 S 1,300.00 FY25 .55/sf FY25 S 250.00 FY25 to be quoted FY25 N/A FY25 S 715.00 FY25 S 21,470.00
FY26 S 490.00 FY26 .25/sf FY26 S 1,400.00 FY26 .55/sf FY26 S 250.00 FY26 to be quoted FY26 N/A FY26 S 715.00 FY26 S 21,470.00
Bid Totals from above|
FY 2024 S 39,951.00 S 45,093.69 S 55,998.00 S 69,408.00 S 77,499.00 S 73,694.97 S 82,639.44 $  82,359.00 $  326,700.00
FY 2025 S 53,268.00 S 61,868.76 S 76,860.00 S 92,544.00 S 103,332.00 $  103,173.12 $  115,695.12 $ 109,812.00 $  435,600.00
FY 2026 S 56,352.00 S 63,663.00 $ 79,128.00 S 92,544.00 S 106,430.52 $  108,331.44 S 121,479.84 $ 109,812.00 S 436,200.00
Total (FY24 to FY 26) S 149,571.00 S 170,625.45 $ 211,986.00 $ 254,496.00 S 287,261.52 $285,199.53 $319,814.40 $301,983.00 $1,198,500.00
Addenda Acknowledge y Y Y Y N N Y N Y
Bid Signed y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y y
References y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y y
Cert of Good Faith y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y y
Cert Taxes Paid y Y Y Y T T Y Y y
Cert Non Conflict Interest y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y y
Cert Non-Collusion Statement y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y y
Indemnification y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y y
Authority of Bid Signatory y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y y
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Contractural Custodial Services FY24-26

Apparent Bidder|

Uncle Sam's Contractors LLC
90 Roberts Street, Ste 302
East Hartford, CT 06108

PO Box 8162
Manchester CT 06040

AllPro Cleaning Services
134 Flanders Road, Ste 325
Westborough, MA 01581

S.J. Services
235 Newbury St
Danvers, MA 01923

Thursday, September 7 2023; 11:00 AM

Dynamic Janitorial Cleaning, Inc.
176 Main Street
Milford, MA 01757

DISQUALIFIED
Spotless Cleaning, Inc
22 Commerce Blvd, Suite 3
Plainville, MA 02762

Did not use revised addenda

Moura's Cleaning Service Inc.
349 Lunenburg St
Fitchburg, MA 01420

Did not use revised addenda

Partner Facililty Solutions
265 Franklin St, Ste 1702
Boston, MA 02110

DISQUALIFIED
Express Janitorial Service Group
PO Box 80376
Stoneham, MA 02180

Did not use revised addenda

DISQUALIFIED
MrVigne Cleaning Services
1257 Worcester Road 1028

Framingham, MA 01701

form form form
@ Bid Bond - business check Bid Bond - cashiers check Bid Bond 5% Bid Bond - Cert check Bid Bond 5% Bid Bond 5% NO BID SURETY NO BID SURETY
‘g Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Bid Monthly Monthly Bid Monthly Bid
jr > Location Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost] Price Annual Cost} Price Annual Cost] Bid Price Annual Cost] Price Annual Cost| Price Annual Cost}
Comments

Error in Unit Price or extension
As stated amounts on submitted bid
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